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This ground-breaking study reveals the magnitude and impact of African American leadership in
Florida during the post-Civil War era.

Canter Brown's statewide study of African American leadership in Florida from the closing days of the Civil
War until the last two members of a racially integrated town council left office in 1924 reveals that as many
as 1,000 African Americans were influential officeholders and powerful Florida politicians. Not merely a
local occurrence, this leadership was inspired by the African Methodist Episcopal Church (AME) and was
later supported by a national labor organization, the Knights of Labor. Brown not only focuses on the
broader significance of these leaders but also provides a personal glimpse at their challenges and
accomplishments, revealing the human side of their leadership and examining who they were, where they
came from, what kinds of experiences they had, and what happened to them.

Not merely a local or regionalized study, this is the first statewide study of African American public officials
in Florida. In addition to providing context and a historical narrative of black leadership in post-Civil War
Florida, this work includes an extensive biographical directory of more than 600 officeholders, containing
brief biographical sketches and more than 40 portraits. Brown also includes an appendix of officials by
political subdivision, providing an excellent reference work for several disciplines.

Brown ably demonstrates that blacks were major forces in Florida politics, who labored against increasingly
difficult odds to maintain a voice in public affairs.
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Lee:

The book Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a book Florida's
Black Public Officials, 1867-1924? Wide variety you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim
that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all
of these. Book Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 has simple shape however you know: it has great
and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

James Matter:

Here thing why this specific Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 are different and reputable to be
yours. First of all studying a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it which is the content
is as delicious as food or not. Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 giving you information deeper
since different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no reserve that similar with Florida's Black
Public Officials, 1867-1924. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing in
which happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is possible to bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be having difficulties in
bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 in e-book can be
your alternate.

Gregory Anderson:

The reserve with title Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 has lot of information that you can
discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new know-how the information
that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to
understand how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

Lillian Kea:

Exactly why? Because this Florida's Black Public Officials, 1867-1924 is an unordinary book that the inside
of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will distress you with the secret the idea inside. Reading
this book beside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such incredible way makes the content on
the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good
for you because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This unique book will give
you a lot of advantages than the other book have got such as help improving your expertise and your critical
thinking technique. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book



store hurriedly.
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