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Cancer is recognized as a serious threat to just about everyone alive today. Soon it will overtake heart disease
as the leading cause of death. As for the 'War on Cancer', it has been an abysmal failure after 40 years and
hundreds of billions invested, yet cancer rates are increasing yearly. The truth is they have abandoned
seeking a cure because the real money is made from treating cancer. The lack of progress can be attributed to
the greed of Big Pharma and the Medical Cartel that has controlled American medicine for over 100 years.
Sadly, hundreds of billions in drug profits take priority over the health of Americans. The book compares
orthodox cancer therapy (limited to surgery, radiation and chemo) to natural therapies many of which have
succeeded in curing tens of thousands of terminal patients. But despite this success, they have been
persecuted and suppressed by the government. Tribute is paid to research visionaries, especially biochemist
Dr Otto Warburg, who was awarded two Nobel Prizes for his groundbreaking discovery of the generic cause
of cancer. Yet American medicine has shunned his discoveries in favor of orthodox cancer treatment. In
addition to the investigation of various natural therapies, the book sheds light on the workings of the Medical
Cartel, while in the background three dramatic stories of couples struggling against cancer unfold. Those
patients subjected to orthodox therapy without being given a choice are trapped in the 'Cancer Vortex' with
little hope of recovery. The fact is, cancer exists in all of us, but it can be controlled with knowledge, self
discipline and a healthy immune system. Dr Otto Warburg makes a startling revelation: "The prevention of
cancer requires no government help and no extra money."
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From reader reviews:

Lucille Wood:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to
fill your free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/ holiday.
The first thing you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to try out look for
book, may be the reserve untitled Cancer Vortex can be good book to read. May be it may be best activity to
you.

Adam Jones:

The book untitled Cancer Vortex contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains your ex idea with
easy method. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this.
The book was authored by famous author. The author will take you in the new period of time of literary
works. You can read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can
read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can
available their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.

Mary Alejandro:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the books in the top
listing in your reading list is actually Cancer Vortex. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can
get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking way up and review this guide you can get many
advantages.

Jean Fair:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know
that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your current teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update in relation to something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra
Cancer Vortex.
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