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As against the form-critical approach, which sees the first two psalms as more or less random examples of
the torah and royal types, this study argues for a deliberate and cogent arrangement of the Psalms 1 and 2. A
detailed linguistic analysis of and comparison between these two apparently disparate psalms at the outset of
the book reveals the purpose for their juxtaposition. The principal characters in the first psalm are further
described in the second. The man of Psalm 1 is portrayed in eschatological terms as an impeccable royal,
sacerdotal, and all-conquering military figure. He appears again in Psalm 2 but as a heavenly-enthroned
victorious priest and king. His opponents, the wicked in Psalm 1, are identified in Psalm 2 as recalcitrant
rulers and peoples who reject his rule and seek to do away with him. However, the calculated divine
response to their plotting assures their ultimate defeat unless they submit to him. This cohesive and coherent
introductory pair of psalms sets a pattern at the beginning for reading all those that follow. Indeed, a
thorough understanding of the first two psalms and their integrated message is a prerequisite for
understanding the purpose of the entire book.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Hilton:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important for people. The book Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible
Monographs) was making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information.
It is rather advantages for you. The guide Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs) is
not only giving you more new information but also being your friend when you experience bored. You can
spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Psalms 1-2: Gateway
to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs). You never feel lose out for everything when you read some
books.

Thomas Brim:

This Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs) book is just not ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is actually
information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper a person read a
lot of information you will get. This specific Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs)
without we recognize teach the one who examining it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
always be worry Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs) can bring if you are and
not make your tote space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop
even cell phone. This Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs) having fine
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Irving Wile:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs)
why because the excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you
actually. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly show you to pick up this book.

George Medrano:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon.



The Psalms 1-2: Gateway to the Psalter (Hebrew Bible Monographs) will give you new experience in
looking at a book.
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