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For more than 20 years, Rian Hughes has been a versatile designer, illustrator and lettering artist working for
international clients in the fields of publishing, music, sports, telecommunications, fashion and more. He has
specialized in creating logo designs for the comic industry, notably for DC and Marvel products, including
Batman and Robin, Batgirl, the X-Men, Captain America, Wolverine, The Spirit, The Invisibles, Shade the
Changing Man, and The Atom. He has also designed logos for posters, CDs, and clothing, and produced
branding for clients such as Hasbro, the Cartoon Network, Virgin Airways, Eurostar, and the BBC. This
compendium is packed full of the best of his logo designs and offers an insight into the creative process
behind his work. Preliminary sketches are shown alongside the final design, and accompanied by author
commentary. An essential reference for designers to draw on in branding and other graphic design projects,
the book will also fascinate anyone interested in contemporary culture. This is as good as it gets for those
looking for a source of cool and inspirational logo design.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Peterson:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This Logo-A-Gogo: Branding Pop Culture:
Logos and Design for Comics, Music, Toys, Magazines and More is simple to develop you can read it in the
playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not include much space to bring the actual printed
book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in
your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Donna Moore:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine
you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Logo-A-Gogo: Branding
Pop Culture: Logos and Design for Comics, Music, Toys, Magazines and More which is finding the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Elizabeth Givens:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Logo-A-Gogo: Branding Pop Culture:
Logos and Design for Comics, Music, Toys, Magazines and More can be the respond to, oh how comes? A
fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is
common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Stephanie Carter:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or
even make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real
their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring along with can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this
era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore
this Logo-A-Gogo: Branding Pop Culture: Logos and Design for Comics, Music, Toys, Magazines and More
can make you really feel more interested to read.
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