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Social scientists study complex phenomena about which they often propose intricate hypotheses tested with
linear-interactive or multiplicative terms. While interaction terms are hardly new to social science research,
researchers have yet to develop a common methodology for using and interpreting them. Modeling and
Interpreting Interactive Hypotheses in Regression Analysis provides step-by-step guidance on how to
connect substantive theories to statistical models and how to interpret and present the results.

"Kam and Franzese is a must-have for all empirical social scientists interested in teasing out the complexities
of their data."
---Janet M. Box-Steffensmeier, Ohio State University

"Kam and Franzese have written what will become the definitive source on dealing with interaction terms
and testing interactive hypotheses. It will serve as the standard reference for political scientists and will be
one of those books that everyone will turn to when helping our students or doing our work. But more than
that, this book is the best text I have seen for getting students to really think about the importance of careful
specification and testing of their hypotheses."
---David A. M. Peterson, Texas A&M University

"Kam and Franzese have given scholars and teachers of regression models something they've needed for
years: a clear, concise guide to understanding multiplicative interactions. Motivated by real substantive
examples and packed with valuable examples and graphs, their book belongs on the shelf of every working
social scientist."
---Christopher Zorn, University of South Carolina

"Kam and Franzese make it easy to model what good researchers have known for a long time: many
important and interesting causal effects depend on the presence of other conditions. Their book shows how to
explore interactive hypotheses in your own research and how to present your results. The book is
straightforward yet technically sophisticated. There are no more excuses for misunderstanding,
misrepresenting, or simply missing out on interaction effects!"
---Andrew Gould, University of Notre Dame

Cindy D. Kam is Assistant Professor, Department of Political Science, University of California, Davis.

Robert J. Franzese Jr. is Associate Professor, Department of Political Science, University of Michigan, and
Research Associate Professor, Center for Political Studies, Institute for Social Research, University of
Michigan.

For datasets, syntax, and worksheets to help readers work through the examples covered in the book, visit:
www.press.umich.edu/KamFranzese/Interactions.html
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From reader reviews:

Grace Moreno:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous
ways to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely imagine
the story how the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others.
When you read this Modeling and Interpreting Interactive Hypotheses in Regression Analysis, you are able
to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others,
make them reading a guide.

Karen Johnson:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Modeling and Interpreting Interactive Hypotheses in Regression Analysis will give you
a new experience in studying a book.

Larry Boggs:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Modeling and Interpreting
Interactive Hypotheses in Regression Analysis is simple bringing you can read it in the recreation area, in the
beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often
the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Robbie Lewis:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This publication Modeling and Interpreting Interactive Hypotheses in Regression
Analysis was filled with regards to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your
scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading the book. If you know
how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like at this point,
many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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