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Cledus B. Washington, Jr. is an attractive, hardworking, 50-year-old man with a great sense of humor and
whose world is turned upside down when he becomes a statistic amongst the 20.6 million Americans who
are diagnosed with chronic kidney disease each year. As he comes to grips with his illness, his girlfriend
leaves him, his mother tries to take over his life, and his financial security is severely compromised as his
world shrinks down to monitoring the buzzing sound of his ""lifeline"" that confirms he is alive. Cledus’
story is told with compassion and humor that encompasses the uncertainty, the fears, and the frustration of
day-to-day living while coping with this disease. Readers will share the journey with Cledus as he faces his
challenges, and relates his frustration, his feelings of isolation and his courage as he deals with the life-
sustaining confinement of a dialysis machine. Through a maze of medical examinations, physician
consultations, and endless diagnostic tests, he learns about his disease, treatment options, and how to trust his
heart again.
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Land:

The book That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis?
Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book can give many info
for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that you
take for that, you could give for each other; you may share all of these. Book That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis
has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous
world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Debra Davis:

This That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis usually are reliable for you who want to become a successful person,
why. The explanation of this That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis can be one of many great books you must have is
usually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed a person with information that perhaps will
shock your earlier knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions both in e-book and printed types. Beside that this That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis giving you an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we know it useful in
your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Amy Parr:

This book untitled That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis to be one of several books that best seller in this year, here
is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind of
book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes
you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to
you to past this guide from your list.

Margaret Ochoa:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis book
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for
eliminate your current hunger then you still doubt That Damn (Kidney) Dialysis as good book not simply by
the cover but also from the content. This is one guide that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so
do you still needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.
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