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Meet Sparky. This adorable Dalmation puppy--who's celebrating his SIXTIETH birthday--is an important
member of the team at the fire station. But he's more than just a cute character in a book: Sparky is the
official spokesdog for the National Fire Protection Agency (NFPA), and what he has to say can actually save
lives. This canine hero rescued a little girl and her family, and now he's helping kids become junior fire
inspectors right in their own homes. In colorful, appealing illustrations, Sparky takes a group of young
animals through the neighborhood, pointing out hazards, giving basic fire prevention and safety tips, and
showing them how to be prepared in case of an emergency. From having a working smoke alarm to being
careful with candles and knowing where your exits are, Sparky's advice may be the most important thing
children--and their parents--ever learn.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Overbay:

This Sparky: The Fire Dog book is not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts
which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This particular Sparky: The Fire Dog
without we know teach the one who studying it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't end up
being worry Sparky: The Fire Dog can bring once you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves'
grow to be full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even cellphone. This Sparky: The Fire Dog
having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Wendy Clark:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be consider if those
information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen within you if you take Sparky: The Fire Dog as your daily resource information.

Jeanne Pratt:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer can be Sparky: The Fire Dog why because the amazing cover that make you
consider in regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content will be fantastic as the
outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Suzanne Mitchell:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they get a
half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book Sparky: The Fire Dog to make your current
reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading talent is developing when you similar to reading.
Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the idea about book and studying
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and examine it. Beside that the e-
book Sparky: The Fire Dog can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of that time.
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