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On Divorce is an anti-divorce treatise by Louis de Bonald, originally published in 1801 in response to the
institution of divorce in France in the aftermath of the French Revolution. Examining the social structures of
Christians, Jews, Asians, Greeks, and Romans, On Divorce links a theory of the family to a theory of politics
and argues the family is a basic component of a stable society. As a politician, Bonald gave a crucial anti-
divorce speech in the French legislature that summarized the argument of On Divorce. Due largely to
Bonald’s efforts, France abolished divorce in 1816.

According to Bonald, human society is composed of three interactive societies: religious society, domestic
society (the family), and public society (the state). These societies operate on common principles and can
only be analyzed in relation to one another. Since, in this view, the family, not the individual, is the basic
unit of society, divorce represents a fundamental assault on the social order.

Bonald was one of the three principal founders of conservatism, along with Edmund Burke and Joseph de
Maistre. Bonald’s influence has been felt across the political spectrum and in areas as diverse as political
theory, sociology, and literature. Of great interest to students of political philosophy, this work will be of
equal value to those concerned with divorce and other social questions.
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From reader reviews:

Roberto Reyes:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get great
deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have you
got when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
definitely On Divorce (Library of Conservative Thought).

Brenda Blackmer:

The book untitled On Divorce (Library of Conservative Thought) contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not
necessarily worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by famous author. The author brings
you in the new period of time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read on your
smart phone, or product, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can open up their official web-site and order it. Have a nice examine.

Jessica Jackson:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, you
think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like On Divorce (Library of
Conservative Thought) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Sherri King:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of books in
the top collection in your reading list is actually On Divorce (Library of Conservative Thought). This book
that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking way up
and review this book you can get many advantages.
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