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This comprehensive text highlights the ethical issues that arise for care workers, with a focus on potentially
vulnerable client groups: elderly people, people with learning disabilities, and people with a mental illness.
The book covers the core elements in the care worker's training: promoting anti-discriminatory practice;
maintaining the confidentiality of information; promoting and supporting an individual's rights;
acknowledging an individual's personal beliefs and identity; and supporting individuals through effective
communication. Examples are used to relate the reader's experiences with those of the client group. Each
chapter--supported by action exercises--presents case studies with appropriate problems and includes a
summary of key points, so that the reader is encouraged to put this newly acquired knowledge into practice.
This is a valuable text for every care worker and trainee.
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From reader reviews:

Vincent Overly:

The book Ethics and Values for Care Workers gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You
can utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting strain
or having big problem with the subject. If you can make examining a book Ethics and Values for Care
Workers to be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your
knowledge about some or all subjects. You could know everything if you like start and read a e-book Ethics
and Values for Care Workers. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or
some others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Warner Samuels:

Ethics and Values for Care Workers can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge
in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article
writer giving his/her effort to put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Ethics and Values for Care
Workers however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm
resource facts that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial considering.

Michelle Wilson:

The book untitled Ethics and Values for Care Workers contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains
her idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to
read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary works.
You can read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book
inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it.
Have a nice read.

Lowell Seymour:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book Ethics and Values for Care Workers was vibrant and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book Ethics and Values for Care Workers has many kinds or
category. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and
believe that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it makes
you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading this.
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