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Sharon Meers and Joanna Strober are professionals, wives, and mothers with five young children between
them. They understand the challenges and rewards of two-career households. They also know that families
thrive not in spite of working mothers but because of them. You can have a great career, a great marriage,
and be a great mother. The key is tapping into your best resource and most powerful ally—the man you
married.

After interviewing hundreds of parents and employers, surveying more than a thousand working mothers,
and combing through the latest government and social science research, the authors have discovered that
kids, husbands, and wives all reap huge benefits when couples commit to share equally as breadwinners and
caregivers. Mothers work without guilt, fathers bond with their kids, and children blossom with the attention
of two involved parents.

The starting point? An attitude shift that puts you on the road to 50/50—plus the positive step-by-step advice
in this book.

Here are real-world solutions for parents who want to get ahead in their careers and still get to their
children’s soccer games; strategies for working mothers facing gender bias in the workplace; advice to
fathers new to the homefront; and tips for finding 50/50 solutions to deal with issues of money, time, and
much more.

From “baby boot camp” for new dads to exactly what to say when negotiating a leave with the boss, this
savvy book offers fresh ideas to today’s families. It also offers encouragement, hope, and confidence to any
woman who has ever questioned her choices regarding work and family.
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From reader reviews:

Joan Henderson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples Can Have It All by
Sharing It All. Try to face the book Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples Can Have It All by Sharing It
All as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that
of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you far
more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience
along with knowledge with this book.

James Nadler:

Here thing why this particular Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples Can Have It All by Sharing It All are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good nevertheless it depends in the
content from it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples
Can Have It All by Sharing It All giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any
publication out there but there is no e-book that similar with Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples Can
Have It All by Sharing It All. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this
happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere
like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the paper
book maybe the form of Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples Can Have It All by Sharing It All in e-
book can be your choice.

Yvonne Tetrault:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Getting to 50/50:
How Working Couples Can Have It All by Sharing It All, you can enjoy both. It is very good combination
right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What?
Still don't understand it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Jennifer Powell:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.



You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the Getting to 50/50: How Working Couples Can Have It All by Sharing It All when you
necessary it?
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