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This book provides a general introduction to the R Commander graphical user interface (GUI) to R for
readers who are unfamiliar with R. It is suitable for use as a supplementary text in a basic or intermediate-
level statistics course. It is not intended to replace a basic or other statistics text but rather to complement it,
although it does promote sound statistical practice in the examples. The book should also be useful to
individual casual or occasional users of R for whom the standard command-line interface is an obstacle.

tinyurl.com/RcmdrBook
The site includes data files used in the book and an errata list.

http://socserv.mcmaster.ca/jfox/Books/RCommander/Writing-Rcmdr-Plugins.pdf

Writing R Commander Plug-in Packages
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From reader reviews:

Stacey Thompson:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people
in the world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something
that they don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Using the R
Commander: A Point-and-Click Interface for R (Chapman & Hall/CRC The R Series). All type of book is it
possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Thomas Hill:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent the whole day to reading a reserve. The book Using the R Commander: A Point-and-Click Interface for
R (Chapman & Hall/CRC The R Series) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have
enough space to create this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book
out of your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book features high quality.

Sherrie Beardsley:

The reason why? Because this Using the R Commander: A Point-and-Click Interface for R (Chapman &
Hall/CRC The R Series) is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but
latter it will distress you with the secret it inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who have
write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining method but
still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or
you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as
help improving your expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that
book? If I had been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Nancy Barry:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Using the R
Commander: A Point-and-Click Interface for R (Chapman & Hall/CRC The R Series) which is having the e-
book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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