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In recent years, the leaders of the American evangelical movement have brought their characteristic passion
to the problem of race, notably in the Promise Keepers movement and in reconciliation theology. But the
authors of this provocative new study reveal that despite their good intentions, evangelicals may actually be
preserving America's racial chasm.
In Divided by Faith, Michael O. Emerson and Christian Smith probe the grassroots of white evangelical
America, through a nationwide telephone survey of 2,000 people, along with 200 face-to-face interviews.
The results of their research are surprising. Most white evangelicals, they learned, see no systematic
discrimination against blacks; indeed, they deny the existence of any ongoing racial problem in the United
States. Many of their subjects blamed the continuing talk of racial conflict on the media, unscrupulous black
leaders, and the inability of African Americans to forget the past. What lies behind this perception?
Evangelicals, Emerson and Smith write, are not so much actively racist as committed to a theological view of
the world that makes it difficult for them to see systematic injustice. The evangelical emphasis on
individualism, free will, and personal relationships makes invisible the pervasive injustice that perpetuates
inequality between the races. Most racial problems, they told the authors, can be solved by the repentance
and conversion of the sinful individuals at fault.
Combining a substantial body of evidence with sophisticated analysis and interpretation, Emerson and Smith
throw sharp light on the oldest American dilemma. Despite the best intentions of evangelical leaders and
some positive trends, the authors conclude that real racial reconciliation remains far over the horizon.
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From reader reviews:

Theresa Wilkins:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Divided by Faith: Evangelical Religion and the Problem of Race
in America.

Cassandra Tucker:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well
as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the entire
day to reading a book. The book Divided by Faith: Evangelical Religion and the Problem of Race in America
it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book.
You can m0ore very easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not very costly but this
book provides high quality.

Willie Carlos:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book entitled
Divided by Faith: Evangelical Religion and the Problem of Race in America your thoughts will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a publication then become one form conclusion and
explanation in which maybe you never get prior to. The Divided by Faith: Evangelical Religion and the
Problem of Race in America giving you another experience more than blown away the mind but also giving
you useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern at this point is
your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a sport. Do you
want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Michael Clements:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got learners? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know that
little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,



except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by book. Amount
types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims Divided by Faith:
Evangelical Religion and the Problem of Race in America.
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