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In recent years, entrepreneurs and SMEs have been forced to adapt to a rapidly changing, increasingly
globalized world, an evolution that has had a profound impact on marketing strategies. This timely volume
identifies the many new opportunities available to entrepreneurs and SMEs in the global marketplace, and
offers tactical and strategic marketing approaches to help them succeed in the modern business world.

The book provides solutions to current marketing challenges and leads the reader through the marketing
process, supported with real-life examples. Discussions of hyper competition and the opportunities arising
from information-communication technology offer a deeper understanding of modern consumers and ways
to create added value through products, services and other entities. The authors stress the importance of an
SME's web presence and internationalization, as well as innovation and branding processes. Additional key
topics include the development of services and experiences with customer co-creation, value-based pricing
using new market channels and adapted communication tools (including social media), and how these
approaches can lead to increased customer engagement and improved long-term relationships.

This comprehensive book will be a useful resource for both scholars and practitioners with an interest in
entrepreneurship, marketing, and business and management.

Contents: Preface Part I: Understanding Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs and the Challenges they
Face 1. An Understanding of Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs 2. Value, Satisfaction and Customer
Loyalty 3. Marketing Plan 4. The Trends and Challenges for SMEs Marketing in the 21st Century Part II:
Understanding the Market and Consumers 5. Analyzing the Marketing Environment 6. Conducting Market
Research and Forecasting Demand in SMEs 7. Consumer Purchase Behavior Part III: Developing an
Approach to Strategic Marketing 8. Target Marketing: Segmentation, Targeting and Positioning 9.
Challenges and Opportunities for SMEs to Market Diverse Entities 10. Innovation Process in SMEs 11.
Branding in SMEs 12. Setting the Price in SMEs 13. Designing Marketing Channels in SMEs 14. Marketing
Communications in SMEs Index
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From reader reviews:

Shane McKeel:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs: A Global Perspective book is readable
through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer of Marketing
for Entrepreneurs and SMEs: A Global Perspective content conveys thinking easily to understand by many
individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different available as it.
So , do you even now thinking Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs: A Global Perspective is not loveable
to be your top collection reading book?

Emilio Lutz:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get
a lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they
write about the knowledge about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl,
or how to teach your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always
try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of
them is this Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs: A Global Perspective.

Bryan Perry:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
learn. Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs: A Global Perspective can be your answer since it can be read
by you actually who have those short time problems.

Linda Thomas:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, in addition to soon. The Marketing for Entrepreneurs and SMEs: A Global Perspective provide you
with a new experience in reading a book.
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