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His real name was James Aitken, though he was better known as "John the Painter." During the early months
of the American Revolution, he wreaked havoc in England by performing acts of terror on behalf of
America. In this first full-length chronicle of the man who attempted to burn down royal navy yards across
England, Jessica Warner paints a tart and entertaining portrait of the world's first modern terrorist. At the
height of the scare, King George III received daily briefings from his ministers, the Bow Street Runners were
on the chase, newspapers printed sensational stories, and in Parliament a bill was rushed through to suspend
habeas corpus.

This is rollicking popular history with something for every reader: authentic 18th-century atmosphere, timely
social history, international political intrigue, terrorism, chase scenes, spies, a double agent or two, a
jailhouse snitch, the king, a young woman innocently tending her sheep . . . and much more.
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From reader reviews:

Scottie Hicks:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication John the Painter: Terrorist of the
American Revolution will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can
know about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you bored.
It's not make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for best book or ideal book
with you?

Shawn Midkiff:

The book John the Painter: Terrorist of the American Revolution will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find
new book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book John the Painter: Terrorist of the American
Revolution is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so
you can easier to read the book.

Tiffany Hernandez:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the data
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them is this
John the Painter: Terrorist of the American Revolution.

Benjamin Herrera:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled
John the Painter: Terrorist of the American Revolution your head will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every single aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging just
about every word written in a reserve then become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you
never get prior to. The John the Painter: Terrorist of the American Revolution giving you an additional
experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this era.
So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind will be pleased when
you are finished reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out
spare time activity?
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