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When speaking of society’s role in ethics, one tends to think of society as regimenting people through its
customs. Ethics and Social Survival rejects theories that treat ethics as having justification within itself and
contends that ethics can have a grip on humans only if it serves their deep-seated need to live together. It
takes a social-survival view of ethical life and its norms by arguing that ethics looks to society not for
regimentation by customs, but rather for the viability of society. Fisk traces this theme through the work of
various philosophers and builds a consideration of social divisions to show how rationalists fail to realize
their aim of justifying ethical norms across divisions. The book also explores the relation of power and
authority to ethics—without simply dismissing them as impediments—and explains how personal values
such as honesty, modesty, and self-esteem still retain ethical importance. Finally, it shows that basing ethics
on avoiding social collapse helps support familiar norms of liberty, justice, and democracy, and strives to
connect global and local ethics.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Chapman:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Ethics and Social Survival (Routledge Studies in Ethics and Moral
Theory). Try to make book Ethics and Social Survival (Routledge Studies in Ethics and Moral Theory) as
your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you really feel alone and beside that course
make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let us make new experience as well as
knowledge with this book.

Robin Almeida:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Ethics and Social Survival (Routledge
Studies in Ethics and Moral Theory) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied through reading
this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world better then
how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading addiction only for the
geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to
start examining as your good habit, you are able to pick Ethics and Social Survival (Routledge Studies in
Ethics and Moral Theory) become your own starter.

Jack Jackson:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you study a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly because
book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and soon. The Ethics
and Social Survival (Routledge Studies in Ethics and Moral Theory) provide you with a new experience in
examining a book.

Lisa Madruga:

You may spend your free time to see this book this book. This Ethics and Social Survival (Routledge Studies
in Ethics and Moral Theory) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to
soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book.
It is make you easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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