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NOTE: This edition features the same content as the traditional text in a convenient, three-hole-punched,
loose-leaf version. Books a la Carte also offer a great value–this format costs significantly less than a new
textbook. Before purchasing, check with your instructor or review your course syllabus to ensure that you
select the correct ISBN. Several versions of Pearson's MyLab & Mastering products exist for each title,
including customized versions for individual schools, and registrations are not transferable. In addition, you
may need a CourseID, provided by your instructor, to register for and use Pearson's MyLab & Mastering
products.
 
This book is ideal for a one-semester course in statistics, offering a streamlined presentation of Introductory
Statistics: Exploring the World through Data, by Gould/Ryan.
This package includes MyStatLab™.
 
Exploring the World through Data
We live in a data-driven world, and the goal of this text is to teach students how to access and analyze these
data critically. Authors Rob Gould, Colleen Ryan, and Rebecca Wong want students to develop a "data habit
of mind" because learning statistics is an essential life skill that extends beyond the classroom.and
Regardless of their math backgrounds, students will learn how to think about data and how to reason using
data. With a clear, unintimidating writing style and carefully chosen pedagogy, this text makes data analysis
accessible to all students.
 
Personalize learning with MyStatLab
MyStatLab™  from Pearson is the world’s leading online resource for teaching and learning statistics,
integrating interactive homework, assessment, and media in a flexible, easy-to-use format. MyStatLab is a
course management system that delivers improving results in helping individual students succeed.
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From reader reviews:

Hayden Roberts:

This book untitled Essential Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition Plus MyStatLab with Pearson eText --
Access Card Package (2nd Edition) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is
because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this specific book
in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason
for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Hae Hughes:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Essential Statistics,
Books a la Carte Edition Plus MyStatLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package (2nd Edition) which is
having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Delaine Valencia:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
soul or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well
as can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you
personally. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Essential Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition Plus MyStatLab
with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package (2nd Edition) can make you sense more interested to read.

Dennis Carson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know
that little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Numerous books
that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this Essential Statistics, Books a la Carte Edition
Plus MyStatLab with Pearson eText -- Access Card Package (2nd Edition).
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