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Tutankhamun was a boy-king who lived in Egypt over 3,000 years ago. The surprise discovery of his
unplundered tomb in 1922 made him an instant celebrity and one of ancient Egypt's most famous rulers.
Discovered by archaeologist Howard Carter, Tut's burial site contained furniture, jewelry, sculpture, and
other rare and beautiful objects, as well as the mummy itself, adorned with a golden death mask.
This carefully researched collection of 30 ready-to-color illustrations depicts many authentic relics from the
tomb, as well as images from the life of King Tut. Among these scenes are views of the beautiful Queen
Nefertiti, looking in on the royal children; the magnificent temple at Karnak; daily activities at the royal
palace; the crowning of Tutankhamun at the age of eight; and his death some ten years later.
An excellent source of Egyptian pictorial design, as well as information about ancient Egypt, this volume
will delight colorists and anyone fascinated by the magnificent civilization that flourished along the Nile so
many centuries ago.
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From reader reviews:

Kurtis Henry:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content.
As you may know that book is very important for people. The book King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History
Coloring Book) ended up being making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take
more information. It is quite advantages for you. The guide King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History
Coloring Book) is not only giving you much more new information but also to be your friend when you
sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with the
book King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History Coloring Book). You never feel lose out for everything should
you read some books.

Spencer Fuentes:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look
different you can read a book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent all day every day to reading a e-book. The book King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History Coloring
Book) it is very good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the
particular e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund
but this book offers high quality.

Lloyd Schuler:

Why? Because this King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History Coloring Book) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret the item inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such amazing way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of
advantages than the other book have got such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I have been you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Richard Thompson:

This King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History Coloring Book) is great reserve for you because the content
and that is full of information for you who always deal with world and possess to make decision every
minute. This specific book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no
rambling sentences included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it



only provides straight forward sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering sentences.
Having King Tut Coloring Book (Dover History Coloring Book) in your hand like keeping the world in your
arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen
small right but this guide already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still
doubt in which?
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